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Re: Landfill Closure Update and Trust Payment Requirements
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Leat, Mick <mick.leat@dnr.iowa.gov> Mon, Jul 15, 2024 at 1:35 PM
To: Matt Thelen <matt.thelen@wellmandynamics.com>
Cc: "Roach, Robert" <RRoach@penn-er.com>, Chad Stobbe <Chad.Stobbe@dnr.iowa.gov>, Becky Jolly
<becky.jolly@dnr.iowa.gov>

Matt-

Since you have submitted the required landfill closure permit application  (permit number 88-SDP-04-86) and the
notification of closure, and also have an approved closure plan in place, you are good to go with the landfill closure-
related construction.  At some point during construction, I plan on making a site visit to see how things are going.

I have copied Chad Stobbe on this email chain as he is the DNR person that is currently handling Financial Assurance-
related approvals until you are notified otherwise.

Please let me know if you need anything else.

Mick Leat
Environmental Engineer
Solid Waste and Contaminated Sites Section
Department of Natural Resources
6200 Park Avenue, Suite 200
Des Moines, IA
515-689-6548 mobile 
mick.leat@dnr.iowa.gov
www.iowadnr.gov

 

On Mon, Jul 15, 2024 at 11:19 AM Matt Thelen <matt.thelen@wellmandynamics.com> wrote:
Hello Mick,

As we prepare for the landfill closure work, I wanted to provide an update and revisit the payment requirements
established in the IDNR Trust (attached for reference).  First, we have a signed agreement with a contractor to perform
the dirt work and expect them to begin in the next few weeks.  Do we need the official closure permit in hand to begin or
are we ok to start with the work?  Secondly, there will be a few different vendors/contractors completing all the closure
work including, fence removal and reinstallation, dirt work, surveying, seeding, etc.  Per section 4 of the Trust (provided
below), invoices for work to be paid from the Trust shall be sent to IDNR for review/approval.  Who at IDNR should
these invoices be sent for review and approval?
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Thanks,
Matt
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Matt Thelen | Environmental Engineer
WDC Acquisition LLC
1746 Commerce Road, Creston, IA 50801
Phone:  641-782-0283
Email:  matt.thelen@wellmandynamics.com<mailto:matt.thelen@wellmandynamics.com>
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This e-mail message and any attachment(s) are for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
proprietary and/or confidential information which may be privileged or otherwise protected from disclosure.  Any
unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient(s), please contact
the sender by reply email and destroy the original message and any copies of the message as well as any
attachment(s) to the original message. Opinions expressed in this message are those of the author and do not
necessarily reflect the opinions or views of WDC Acquisition LLC.
EXPORT WARNING: This email may contain technical data or technology that is controlled by the U.S. government
and authorized for export only to the country of ultimate destination for use by the ultimate consignee or end-user(s). It
may not be resold, transferred, or otherwise disposed of, to any other country or to any person other than the
authorized ultimate consignee or end-user(s), either in their original form or after being incorporated into other items,
without first obtaining approval from the U.S. government or as otherwise authorized by U.S. law and regulations.
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