4/23/2021 State of lowa Mail - Re: Harrison County Landfill - Financial Assurance

Jolly, Becky <becky.jolly@dnr.iowa.gov>

Re: Harrison County Landfill - Financial Assurance
1 message

Blum, Bill <bill.blum@dnr.iowa.gov> Fri, Apr 23, 2021 at 1:26 PM
To: Harrison County Landfill <hclco@iowatelecom.net>, "Jolly, Becky" <becky.jolly@dnr.iowa.gov>
Cc: Lauren Norland <Inorland@evora-group.com>

extension of the due-date to June 30 is granted.

Bill Blum *program planner
Land Quality Bureau/Financial & Business Assistance

lowa Department of Natural Resources
www.jowadnr.gov ph. 515-240-6048

502 E 9th St, Des Moines, IA 50319

On Fri, Apr 23, 2021 at 12:34 PM <hclco@iowatelecom.net> wrote:

Mr. Blum,

The Harrison County Landfill would like to request an extension for the submittal of the 2021 Financial Assurance

report until June 30th, 2021. The county has not finished its annual audit. We are waiting on those results to complete
the report, as the county acts as our Guarantor. On March 24th, 2021 deposited $36,179 towards our F.A.M. account
and rolled over $29,000 in accrued interest. Thank you for your understanding.

Have a great weekend!

Tyler Hinkel

Harrison County Landfill Manager

Phone: 712-644-3093

Mobile: 712-592-9975

Email: HCLCO@iowatelecom.net

2812 Hwy 30

Logan, IA 51546
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