.
lowagov Cook, Dan <dan.cook@dnr.iowa.gov>

RE: RGG INDR sample review and report/remediation requirement
1 message

Melanie McIntosh <mmcintosh@agrexinc.com> Thu, Oct 31, 2019 at 5:11 PM
To: "Cook, Dan" <dan.cook@dnr.iowa.gov>
Cc: Kimberly Thorstad <kimberly_thorstad@cargill.com>, Kurt Levetzow <kurt.levetzow@dnr.iowa.gov>, "TAKASHI A SUZUKI (MC-MCA)" <takashi.a.suzuki@mitsubishicorp.com>

Dear Mr. Cook,

Thank you so much. | have given the landowner notice as per our previous lease requirement that you will be reaching out. His contact information is as follows:

Jeff Goldstein - Chairman of Board

T: 563-344-5111 | M: 563-529-1645
Jeff.Goldstein@alterlogistics.com | WWW.ALTERLOGISTICS.COM
2117 State Street, Suite 300 | Bettendorf, IA 52722-5030

Please let me know if you need anything else.

Melanie

Sincerely,

Melanie MclIntosh

Assistant General Manager

Legal, Compliance and Administration
Agrex, Inc.

8205 W. 108" Terrace, Suite 200
Overland Park, KS 66210
913-851-6367 (office)

816-206-0458 (cell)
913-851-6267 (fax)

From: Cook, Dan <dan.cook@dnr.iowa.gov>

Sent: Thursday, October 31, 2019 2:56 PM

To: Melanie McIntosh <mmcintosh@agrexinc.com>

Cc: Kimberly Thorstad <kimberly_thorstad@cargill.com>; Kurt Levetzow <kurt.levetzow@dnr.iowa.gov>
Subject: Re: RGG INDR sample review and report/remediation requirement

Hi Melanie

Attached is the letter requiring additional remedial efforts we spoke of earlier today with a deadline of approximately December 30th for the submittal of a remedial action work
plan, the paper copy will go out in the mail today. | know we spoke of trying to get the soil removed as soon as possible (before the ground freezes) but that might be too hard to
accomplish with all the planning that needs to be done. So just keep the process going without having to pay for expedited services.

Also, as we spoke of, | will be contacting the land owner to complete an environmental assessment of the site to address the concerns of the possible legacy petroleum release.

If you have any questions please ask,

Dan

Daniel Cook | Environmental Specialist Senior

lowa Department of Natural Resources
Contaminated Sites Section
P 515-725-8371 | F 515-725-8202 | 502 E. 9th St., Des Moines, IA 50319
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On Fri, Oct 25, 2019 at 4:12 PM Melanie Mclntosh <mmcintosh@agrexinc.com> wrote:

Dear Mr. Cook,

Happy Friday! | am copying counsel for Cargill (new owner of the RGG facility). When you issue your report, findings and/or remediation requirement, can you kindly send it
to both of us so that we can coordinate efforts? Thank you so much. Have a lovely weekend!

Melanie

Sincerely,

Melanie Mcintosh

Assistant General Manager

Legal, Compliance and Administration
Agrex, Inc.

8205 W. 108! Terrace, Suite 200
Overland Park, KS 66210
913-851-6367 (office)

816-206-0458 (cell)
913-851-6267 (fax)


https://nam04.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.iowadnr.gov%2F&data=02%7C01%7C%7Ca215274bcc494711a67008d75e3c5e36%7C2dfde71103b749e29ef5d8961bb1108f%7C0%7C0%7C637081486673435795&sdata=m8Z1hMFt6Y9%2FGeW7DezLnDfIfPa9XQuURiQIL8pCmBk%3D&reserved=0
mailto:mmcintosh@agrexinc.com
https://www.google.com/maps/search/8205+W.+108?entry=gmail&source=g

